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                  “Take an educated approach to IT management…                             

…Do you make the grade?” 
                                            

16 Ways HUBtech Can Help K-12 Institutions 

 

 
Security Assessment 
It’s important to establish a 
baseline and close existing 

vulnerabilities. When was your last 
assessment? Date _____________ 

 
MFA (Multi-Factor 

Authentication) 
 Utilize MFA whenever you can; 

including on your network, banking 
websites, and even social media. It 

adds an additional layer of 
protection to ensure that even if 
your password does get stolen, 

your data stays protected. 

 
Advanced Endpoint 

Detection & Response 
Protect your computers data from 

malware, viruses, and cyber-
attacks with advanced endpoint 

security. Today’s latest technology 
(which replaces your outdated 

anti-virus solution) protects against 
file-less and script-based threats 

and can even rollback a 
ransomware attack. 

 
Spam Email 

Secure your email. Most attacks 
originate in your email. We’ll help 
you choose a service designed to 

reduce spam and your exposure to 
attacks on your staff via email. 

 

 
Next Gen Firewall 

 Turn on Intrusion Detection and 
Intrusion Prevention features. Send 

the log files to a managed SIEM. 
And if your IT team doesn’t know 

what these things are, call us 
today! 

 
Secure Wireless 

Segregate and secure wireless 
network traffic. Keep the intruders 

out. Call for a Wireless Network 
Assessment today! 

 
Security Awareness 

Train your users – often! Teach 
them about data security, email 

attacks, and your policies and 
procedures. We offer a web-based 

training solution and “done for 
you” security policies 

 
Penetration Testing 

Test your perimeter network for 
potential security holes. Network 
breaches come in all shapes and 

sizes. Don’t be a victim. 

 

 
Backup and Disaster 

Recovery 
Backup local. Backup to the cloud. 

Have an offline backup for each 
month of the year. Test your 

backups often. And if you aren’t 
convinced your backups aren’t 
working properly, call us ASAP. 

 
Passwords 

Store passwords in a secure vault. 
Apply security policies on your 

network. Examples: Deny or limit 
USB file storage access, enable 

enhanced password policies, set 
user screen timeouts, and limit 

user access.  

 
Social Media Archiving 
Social Media Capture, Archiving 

and Compliance Solutions 
Designed to engage across a wide 

range of social media channels, 
from Tweets to LinkedIn inbox 

messages, your content is easy to 
access, review, and produce on 

demand—and in accordance with 
regulatory compliance guidance. 

 
Digital Classroom – 

Teacher 
Having the latest teaching 

technology is important to molding 
our children’s future and keeping 
them safe in the process. Make 

teaching simpler and more 
engaging. 

 

 

  
Policy  

Cyber policies are important to 
ensure best practices are defined 
and adhered to. HUB can help you 
take the guesswork out of creating 

this documentation. 

 
Chromebook Enrollment 

and Management 
Students rely on Chromebooks to 
learn new skills and communicate, 
collaborate with other inside and 

out of the classroom. 

 
Imaging & Deployment 

Services 
Ensuring your hardware is up to 

date is extremely important to the 
security of your environment. 
Ensure your hardware stays 

current without lifting a finger.  

 
Managed IT Services 
Outsource your IT needs and 

reduce operating costs. HUB can 
provide a custom solution to fit 

your needs. 
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